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The Sword Thief: The 39 Clues is the first book in a thrilling adventure
series that will keep you on the edge of your seat. With its fast-paced action
and intriguing mystery, this book is perfect for readers of all ages.

The story follows Amy and Dan Cahill, two orphans who are thrust into a
dangerous game when they discover that they are part of a secret family of
treasure hunters. The Cahill family has been searching for the 39 Clues, a
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collection of powerful artifacts that can grant the possessor ultimate power.
Amy and Dan must race against time to find the Clues before they fall into
the wrong hands.

Along the way, Amy and Dan will travel to exotic locations, solve puzzles,
and face dangerous enemies. They will also learn more about their own
family history and the secrets that have been kept from them. The Sword
Thief is a fast-paced, action-packed adventure that will keep you guessing
until the very end.

What readers are saying about The Sword Thief: The 39 Clues

"This book is amazing! I couldn't put it down." - Our Book Library
reviewer

"The Sword Thief is a great read for kids and adults alike. It's full of
adventure, mystery, and humor." - Goodreads reviewer

"This book is a must-read for any fan of adventure stories." - School
Library Journal

Free Download your copy of The Sword Thief today!

The Sword Thief: The 39 Clues is available in paperback, hardcover, and
ebook formats. You can Free Download your copy from Our Book Library,
Barnes & Noble, or your local bookstore.

About the author

Rick Riordan is the author of the Percy Jackson and the Olympians series,
the Heroes of Olympus series, and the Magnus Chase and the Gods of
Asgard series. His books have sold over 100 million copies worldwide and



have been translated into 37 languages. Riordan lives in Boston,
Massachusetts with his wife and two sons.

Other books in the 39 Clues series

The Sword Thief is just the first book in the exciting 39 Clues series. There
are a total of 11 books in the series, each one following Amy and Dan Cahill
as they search for the 39 Clues. The other books in the series include:

The Maze of Bones

The Black Circle

The Viper's Nest

The Emperor's Code

The Ring of Spies

The Serpent's Shadow

The Black Sun

The Dead of Night

The Labyrinth of Bones

The Black Sparrow

Read the 39 Clues series today!

The 39 Clues series is a thrilling adventure that will keep you on the edge
of your seat. With its fast-paced action, intriguing mystery, and lovable
characters, this series is perfect for readers of all ages. Free Download
your copy of The Sword Thief today and start your adventure!
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